
pipe
opening

tooth

wide lower lip

narrow lower lip

wide lower lip narrow top lip

thumb tab

Position wide top lip over the back 
edge to hook onto bracket

Install CTS pipe or stub out into pipe 
hole opening.

Then align tooth with hole in bracket. 
Install the clamp from the flat side 
(face) of the bracket.

Push thumb tab down and slightly 
forward to engage both edges of the 
bracket.

Use thumb and push wide lower lip 
onto bracket to engage the clamp.

Completed installation.

1

4

2

5

3

6

Installation Guide

Supply Drainage Support Specialties

pipe
opening

tooth

wide lower lip

narrow lower lip

wide lower lip narrow top lip

thumb tab

Position wide top lip over the back 
edge to hook onto bracket

Install CTS pipe or stub out into pipe 
hole opening.

Then align tooth with hole in bracket. 
Install the clamp from the flat side 
(face) of the bracket.

Push thumb tab down and slightly 
forward to engage both edges of the 
bracket.

Use thumb and push wide lower lip 
onto bracket to engage the clamp.

Completed installation.

1

4

2

5

3

6

Installation Guide

Supply Drainage Support Specialties

pipe
opening

tooth

wide lower lip

narrow lower lip

wide lower lip narrow top lip

thumb tab

Position wide top lip over the back 
edge to hook onto bracket

Install CTS pipe or stub out into pipe 
hole opening.

Then align tooth with hole in bracket. 
Install the clamp from the flat side 
(face) of the bracket.

Push thumb tab down and slightly 
forward to engage both edges of the 
bracket.

Use thumb and push wide lower lip 
onto bracket to engage the clamp.

Completed installation.

1

4

2

5

3

6

Installation Guide

Supply Drainage Support Specialties

pipe
opening

tooth

wide lower lip

narrow lower lip

wide lower lip narrow top lip

thumb tab

Position wide top lip over the back 
edge to hook onto bracket

Install CTS pipe or stub out into pipe 
hole opening.

Then align tooth with hole in bracket. 
Install the clamp from the flat side 
(face) of the bracket.

Push thumb tab down and slightly 
forward to engage both edges of the 
bracket.

Use thumb and push wide lower lip 
onto bracket to engage the clamp.

Completed installation.

1

4

2

5

3

6

Installation Guide

Supply Drainage Support Specialties



#IS-520-E

Supply Drainage Support Specialties

Use screws or nails to secure bracket to either the front or 
inside of stud.

Bend in both tabs to fit the bracket inside the stud bay.

For narrow stud bays, break perforation at the corner of the bracket to best fit the opening.

CAUTION: Brackets have sharp edges.
Wear gloves and use caution when installing the product.
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